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HOW IT WORKS
Join the Promotion through poker client by pressing the Opt-In button. Then, complete the daily
missions and get  a scratch card to win random rewards.
Cash game missions must be completed on the following cash game tables: No Limit  Texas
Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up and Pot Limit Omaha tables excluded.
DAILY MISSIONS
Date Daily Mission 01-Dec-2024 Play an Elite  Series Opener tournament (Minimum buy in €50)
02-Dec-2024 Win 3 Twisters (Minimum buy in €5) 03-Dec-2024 Flop 3 of a  kind (whilst holding a
pair in your hand) on cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds.
Heads  up tables excluded) 04-Dec-2024 Knock out a player in an Elite Series PKO tournament
(Minimum buy in €10) 05-Dec-2024 Win  with KK at showdown at cash game tables (No Limit
Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up tables excluded) 06-Dec-2024  Get Dealt
99 whilst playing Twister (Minimum buy in €10) 07-Dec-2024 Play an Elite Series Mystery Bounty
Day-1 tournament (Minimum  buy in €25) 08-Dec-2024 Get Dealt JJ two times on cash game
tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds.  Heads up tables excluded) 09-Dec-
2024 Make it ITM in an Elite Series tournament (Minimum buy in €5) 10-Dec-2024 Win 2  Twisters
(Minimum buy in €10) 11-Dec-2024 See the flop 50 times on cash game tables (No Limit Texas
Hold’em: €0.05/0.10  minimum blinds. Heads up tables excluded) 12-Dec-2024 Play 2 Elite Series
tournaments (Minimum buy in €10) 13-Dec-2024 Play 4 Twisters  (Minimum buy in €5) 14-Dec-
2024 Collect 2 knockouts in Elite Series PKO tournaments (Minimum buy in €5) 15-Dec-2024 Get
Dealt  AA, KK or QQ 3 times on cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum
blinds. Heads up tables  excluded) 16-Dec-2024 Play an Elite Series Mini Main Day-1 Flight
tournament (buy in €30) 17-Dec-2024 Win 2 Twisters in a  row (Minimum buy in €5) 18-Dec-2024
Play 2 non-PKO Elite Series tournaments (Minimum buy in €10) 19-Dec-2024 Win with 1010  on
cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up tables
excluded) 20-Dec-2024 Play 10 Twisters (Minimum  buy in €2) 21-Dec-2024 See the flop 50 times
on cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds.  Heads up tables
excluded) 22-Dec-2024 Play 2 Elite Series Flighted Events (Minimum buy in €3) 23-Dec-2024 Get
Dealt 1010 whilst  playing Twister (Minimum buy in €5) 24-Dec-2024 Get Dealt 22 and AA on cash
game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em:  €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up tables excluded)  
 
Partilha de casos
 
HOW IT WORKS
Join the Promotion through poker client by pressing the Opt-In button. Then, complete the daily
missions and get  a scratch card to win random rewards.
Cash game missions must be completed on the following cash game tables: No Limit  Texas
Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up and Pot Limit Omaha tables excluded.
DAILY MISSIONS
Date Daily Mission 01-Dec-2024 Play an Elite  Series Opener tournament (Minimum buy in €50)
02-Dec-2024 Win 3 Twisters (Minimum buy in €5) 03-Dec-2024 Flop 3 of a  kind (whilst holding a
pair in your hand) on cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds.
Heads  up tables excluded) 04-Dec-2024 Knock out a player in an Elite Series PKO tournament
(Minimum buy in €10) 05-Dec-2024 Win  with KK at showdown at cash game tables (No Limit
Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up tables excluded) 06-Dec-2024  Get Dealt



99 whilst playing Twister (Minimum buy in €10) 07-Dec-2024 Play an Elite Series Mystery Bounty
Day-1 tournament (Minimum  buy in €25) 08-Dec-2024 Get Dealt JJ two times on cash game
tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds.  Heads up tables excluded) 09-Dec-
2024 Make it ITM in an Elite Series tournament (Minimum buy in €5) 10-Dec-2024 Win 2  Twisters
(Minimum buy in €10) 11-Dec-2024 See the flop 50 times on cash game tables (No Limit Texas
Hold’em: €0.05/0.10  minimum blinds. Heads up tables excluded) 12-Dec-2024 Play 2 Elite Series
tournaments (Minimum buy in €10) 13-Dec-2024 Play 4 Twisters  (Minimum buy in €5) 14-Dec-
2024 Collect 2 knockouts in Elite Series PKO tournaments (Minimum buy in €5) 15-Dec-2024 Get
Dealt  AA, KK or QQ 3 times on cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum
blinds. Heads up tables  excluded) 16-Dec-2024 Play an Elite Series Mini Main Day-1 Flight
tournament (buy in €30) 17-Dec-2024 Win 2 Twisters in a  row (Minimum buy in €5) 18-Dec-2024
Play 2 non-PKO Elite Series tournaments (Minimum buy in €10) 19-Dec-2024 Win with 1010  on
cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up tables
excluded) 20-Dec-2024 Play 10 Twisters (Minimum  buy in €2) 21-Dec-2024 See the flop 50 times
on cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds.  Heads up tables
excluded) 22-Dec-2024 Play 2 Elite Series Flighted Events (Minimum buy in €3) 23-Dec-2024 Get
Dealt 1010 whilst  playing Twister (Minimum buy in €5) 24-Dec-2024 Get Dealt 22 and AA on cash
game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em:  €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up tables excluded)  
 
Expanda pontos de conhecimento
 
HOW IT WORKS
Join the Promotion through poker client by pressing the Opt-In button. Then, complete the daily
missions and get  a scratch card to win random rewards.
Cash game missions must be completed on the following cash game tables: No Limit  Texas
Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up and Pot Limit Omaha tables excluded.
DAILY MISSIONS
Date Daily Mission 01-Dec-2024 Play an Elite  Series Opener tournament (Minimum buy in €50)
02-Dec-2024 Win 3 Twisters (Minimum buy in €5) 03-Dec-2024 Flop 3 of a  kind (whilst holding a
pair in your hand) on cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds.
Heads  up tables excluded) 04-Dec-2024 Knock out a player in an Elite Series PKO tournament
(Minimum buy in €10) 05-Dec-2024 Win  with KK at showdown at cash game tables (No Limit
Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up tables excluded) 06-Dec-2024  Get Dealt
99 whilst playing Twister (Minimum buy in €10) 07-Dec-2024 Play an Elite Series Mystery Bounty
Day-1 tournament (Minimum  buy in €25) 08-Dec-2024 Get Dealt JJ two times on cash game
tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds.  Heads up tables excluded) 09-Dec-
2024 Make it ITM in an Elite Series tournament (Minimum buy in €5) 10-Dec-2024 Win 2  Twisters
(Minimum buy in €10) 11-Dec-2024 See the flop 50 times on cash game tables (No Limit Texas
Hold’em: €0.05/0.10  minimum blinds. Heads up tables excluded) 12-Dec-2024 Play 2 Elite Series
tournaments (Minimum buy in €10) 13-Dec-2024 Play 4 Twisters  (Minimum buy in €5) 14-Dec-
2024 Collect 2 knockouts in Elite Series PKO tournaments (Minimum buy in €5) 15-Dec-2024 Get
Dealt  AA, KK or QQ 3 times on cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum
blinds. Heads up tables  excluded) 16-Dec-2024 Play an Elite Series Mini Main Day-1 Flight
tournament (buy in €30) 17-Dec-2024 Win 2 Twisters in a  row (Minimum buy in €5) 18-Dec-2024
Play 2 non-PKO Elite Series tournaments (Minimum buy in €10) 19-Dec-2024 Win with 1010  on
cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up tables
excluded) 20-Dec-2024 Play 10 Twisters (Minimum  buy in €2) 21-Dec-2024 See the flop 50 times
on cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds.  Heads up tables
excluded) 22-Dec-2024 Play 2 Elite Series Flighted Events (Minimum buy in €3) 23-Dec-2024 Get
Dealt 1010 whilst  playing Twister (Minimum buy in €5) 24-Dec-2024 Get Dealt 22 and AA on cash
game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em:  €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up tables excluded)  
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comentário do comentarista
 
HOW IT WORKS
Join the Promotion through poker client by pressing the Opt-In button. Then, complete the daily
missions and get  a scratch card to win random rewards.
Cash game missions must be completed on the following cash game tables: No Limit  Texas
Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up and Pot Limit Omaha tables excluded.
DAILY MISSIONS
Date Daily Mission 01-Dec-2024 Play an Elite  Series Opener tournament (Minimum buy in €50)
02-Dec-2024 Win 3 Twisters (Minimum buy in €5) 03-Dec-2024 Flop 3 of a  kind (whilst holding a
pair in your hand) on cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds.
Heads  up tables excluded) 04-Dec-2024 Knock out a player in an Elite Series PKO tournament
(Minimum buy in €10) 05-Dec-2024 Win  with KK at showdown at cash game tables (No Limit
Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up tables excluded) 06-Dec-2024  Get Dealt
99 whilst playing Twister (Minimum buy in €10) 07-Dec-2024 Play an Elite Series Mystery Bounty
Day-1 tournament (Minimum  buy in €25) 08-Dec-2024 Get Dealt JJ two times on cash game
tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds.  Heads up tables excluded) 09-Dec-
2024 Make it ITM in an Elite Series tournament (Minimum buy in €5) 10-Dec-2024 Win 2  Twisters
(Minimum buy in €10) 11-Dec-2024 See the flop 50 times on cash game tables (No Limit Texas
Hold’em: €0.05/0.10  minimum blinds. Heads up tables excluded) 12-Dec-2024 Play 2 Elite Series
tournaments (Minimum buy in €10) 13-Dec-2024 Play 4 Twisters  (Minimum buy in €5) 14-Dec-
2024 Collect 2 knockouts in Elite Series PKO tournaments (Minimum buy in €5) 15-Dec-2024 Get
Dealt  AA, KK or QQ 3 times on cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum
blinds. Heads up tables  excluded) 16-Dec-2024 Play an Elite Series Mini Main Day-1 Flight
tournament (buy in €30) 17-Dec-2024 Win 2 Twisters in a  row (Minimum buy in €5) 18-Dec-2024
Play 2 non-PKO Elite Series tournaments (Minimum buy in €10) 19-Dec-2024 Win with 1010  on
cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up tables
excluded) 20-Dec-2024 Play 10 Twisters (Minimum  buy in €2) 21-Dec-2024 See the flop 50 times
on cash game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em: €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds.  Heads up tables
excluded) 22-Dec-2024 Play 2 Elite Series Flighted Events (Minimum buy in €3) 23-Dec-2024 Get
Dealt 1010 whilst  playing Twister (Minimum buy in €5) 24-Dec-2024 Get Dealt 22 and AA on cash
game tables (No Limit Texas Hold’em:  €0.05/0.10 minimum blinds. Heads up tables excluded)  
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